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GROUP 1{BALLASTS UNIT
30 ea. PRICE 11.61 12.51 11.45 10.92 10.73 12.34
BALLAST 2LMP 120V R2S40TP, Item: Rapid Start R2s40 TP or Sola E-620 F-240-TP, Lawson No. 9356 TOTAL 348.30 375.30 343.50 327.60 321.90 370.20
Philips Advance Philips GE Halco Philips/Advance
1. Mfg./Model MFR/MODEL GE 74472 RELB2S40ON35| ICN2S40N351 GE240 RS-MV-N 50160 ICN2S40N35I
20 ea. UNIT PRICE 16.03 18.38 20.48 15.03 14.18 22.08
BALLAST MAX N ULTRA 8FT T-8, GE 49767 or Sola E 758 U 259 SC, Lawson No. 26182 TOTAL 320.60 367.60 409.60 300.60 283.60 441.60
Sylvania 49590 Philips GE Halco Philips/Advance
2. Mfg./Model MFR/MODEL GE 49767 QTP2X59T8/UNV-ISN-SC 10P2P59SC351 GE259 MAX N-Ultra 50136 10P2P59SC35I
40 ea. UNIT PRICE 16.03 18.38 20.48 15.03 14.18 22.08
BALLAST ULTRA MAX T-8 120 to 277 volts, Item: GE-259-Max-N/ultra TOTAL 641.20 735.20 819.20 601.20 567.20 883.20
Sylvania 49590 Philips GE Halco Philips/Advance
3. Mfg./Model MFR/MODEL GE 49767 QTP2X59T8/UNV-ISN-SC 10P2P59SC351 GE 259 MAX N/M/Ultra 50136 10P2P59SC351
60 ea. UNIT PRICE 10.00 8.55 27.80 9.79 9.79 29.96
BALLAST SOLA 120 volts 0.60 amp 215 ocv 60hz, Sola ETSF-20-TP TOTAL 600.00 513.00 1,668.00 587.40 587.40 1,797.60
4. Mfg./Model MFR/MODEL GE 68187 Philips Advance LC1420CI | Philips RL2SP20TP1 ETSF20TP Keystone KTEB-120-1-TP-EMI Philips/Advance RL2SP20TPI
150 ea. UNIT PRICE 16.00 20.95 19.03 15.00 14.18 21.75
BALLAST TYPE ELCTRONIC 120 volts - 277 volts/50/60hz STARTING METHOD-PRGRAMMED START, TOTAL 2,400.00 3,142.50 2,854.50 2,250.00 2,127.00 3,262.50
PHILIPS SMART MATE ICF-ZS26-H1-LD Philips Advance Philips GE Halco Philips
5. Mfg./Model MFR/MODEL GE 63097 ICF2S26H1LDK ICF2S26HILDK [ GEC 226-MVPS-3W 52106 ICF2S26H1LDK
40 ea. UNIT PRICE 11.11 12.69 11.45 10.63 10.91 12.34
BALLAST ULTRA MAX T-8/120-277 volts-L, GE 332 max-L/ultra TOTAL 444.40 507.60 458.00 425.20 436.40 493.60
Sylvania 49839 Philips GE Halco Philips
6. Mfg./Model MFR/MODEL GE 78621 QHE3X32T8/UNV-ISL-SC IOPA3P32LWN351 GE 332 MAX L/Ultra 50122 IOPA3P32LWN351
30 ea. UNIT PRICE 9.44 12.20 10.24 8.85 8.78 11.04
BALLAST ULTRA MAX t-8/120-277 volts low light, GE 232 max-L/ultra TOTAL 283.20 366.00 307.20 265.50 263.40 331.20
Sylvania 49863 Phinps GE Hailco Phips
7. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 72262 QHE2X32T8/UNV-ISL-SC | IOPA2P32LWN351 GE 232 MAX L/Ultra 50116 I0PA2P32LWN351
30 ea. UNIT PRICE 11.11 12.20 12.65 10.94 12.24 13.64
CENTIUM ELE BALLAST (2) ROHS compliant 4 120-277 volts 50-60hz F32T8 120-277 volt, PHILLIPS F32T8RS/IS TOTAL 333.30 366.00 379.50 328.20 367.20 409.20
Sylvania 49863 Philips GE Halco Philips/Advance
8. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 74463 QHE2X32T8/UNV-ISL-SC | IOPA4P32LWN351 GE432 MV/N 50126 10PA4P32LWN351
120 ea. UNIT PRICE 17.78 20.42 20.17 18.54 17.89 22.60
BALLAST ROHS complaint 2 4 pin 120-277 volts 60 hz, FT40W CFL TOTAL 2,133.60 2,450.40 2,420.40 2,224.80 2,146.80 2,712.00
Sylvania 49429 Fnps GE Haico Pnps/Aavance
9. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 71435 QHE2X40DL/UNV-ISN-SC ICF2S42M2LDK GE 240 MVPS/A 52108 ICN2TTP40SC3SI
UNIT PRICE
TOTAL
10. ITEM DELETED MFR/MODEL
*
Total for Group 1 TOTAL 7,504.60 8,823.60 9,659.90 7,310.50 7,100.90 10,701.10
Price List Catalog Number UNIT 165CC 9200-D
Discount Off Price List (%) PRICE 40% 64.4% 50%
Multiplier for Discount TOTAL 0.600 0.356
Effective Date of Price List MFR/MODEL 7/1/12 2013-2016 July 1, 2019
GROUP 2|LED BALLASTS UNIT
10 ea. PRICE 116.11 92.95 69.29 62.30 81.04
BALLAST LED 1 out 75W/3.26A 0-10V Dimming 1.8-3.26 ADC 18-23 volt, Phillips Advance LED INTA0024V30 DLO TOTAL 1,161.10 929.50 692.90 623.00 NO BID 810.40
Philips Advance
1. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL Phillips Advance LEDINTA0024V30DLO LEDINTA0024V30DLO Advance
UNIT PRICE *
TOTAL
Total for Group 2 MFR/MODEL 1,161.10 929.50 692.90 623.00 NO BID 810.40
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GROUP 3LAMPS
20 boxes UNIT PRICE 2.96 43.54 51.70 3.28 17.01 5.51
LAMP F26D 4P PLUG 26W 3000K; (10/box), HALCO 1092, Lawson No. 26218 TOTAL 592.00 870.80 1,034.00 65.60 340.20 110.20
Sylvania 20722 Philips GE HALCO Philips
1 Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL Halco 1092 cf26dd/e/830/eco 383356 F26DBX/827/ECO 4 PIN 109092 PL-C 26\W/830/4P/ALTO
700 ea. UNIT PRICE 2.50 1.78 2.61 2.37 2.86 3.05
LAMP FLUORESCENT 4FT 2 PIN T8 F32 TI XL SP41 WM ECO, GE 34397, Lawson No. 26181 TOTAL 1,750.00 1,246.00 1,827.00 1,659.00 2,002.00 2,135.00
Philips
2. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 68856 Halco 109416 Philips 281279 GE F32T8XL/SPX41E2 HALCO 35160 F32T8/ADV811/XLL/ALTO
50 ea. UNIT PRICE 9.46 6.64 7.62 5.58 7.14 8.12
LAMP 8FT F96T8/XL/SP41/WM/ECO, Halco 21736, Lawson No. 26180 TOTAL 473.00 332.00 381.00 279.00 357.00 406.00
Philips
3. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 47103 Philps 236828 Philips 163311 GE F96T8/XL/SP41/WM HALCO 21736 F96T8/ADV841/XEW/ALTO
9 cases UNIT PRICE 7.61 113.03 128.00 7.29 102.33 6.82
LAMP FL TUBE F32 T8/SP30/U6 31W (20/case), GE 10479, Halco 30351, Lawson No. 26216 TOTAL 821.88 1,017.27 1,152.00 65.61 920.97 61.38
Sylvania 22046 Philips GE HALCO Philips
4. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 68920 h032/730/6/ECO 226712 F32T8/SPX30/U66/2 109500 FB31T8/TL 830/ALTO
260 ea. UNIT PRICE 3.04 2.61 2.38 3.13 0.57 2.53
LAMP FLOOD HALOGEN Q50 MR16, GE 20833, Lawson No. 26205 TOTAL 790.40 678.60 618.80 813.80 148.20 657.80
5. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 20833 Philips 378059 Philips 378059 GE Q50MR16/L/FL40 HALCO 107484 Philips 50MR16/FL36
5 ea. UNIT PRICE 1.63 1.56 4.30 1.57 0.42
LAMP INDICATOR TUBE 20W FROST, GE 34211, Lawson No. 13540 TOTAL 8.15 7.80 21.50 7.85 2.10 NO BID
6. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 34211 Sylvania 18143 20T6.5/1F Philips 138123 GE 20T6 1/2DC F HALCO 9030
20 ea. UNIT PRICE 9.24 11.32 11.52 9.90 9.45 12.27
LAMP METAL HALIDE 250U CLEAR, GE 42729, Lawson No. 13489 TOTAL 184.80 226.40 230.40 198.00 189.00 245.40
7. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 42729 Sylvania 64457 M250/U Philips 274845 GE MVR 250/U HALCO 108204 Philips MH250/U
20 ea. UNIT PRICE 0.58 0.39 1.40 0.55 0.12
LAMP MINI 28V BAYONET BASE, Sylvania 1819, Eiko 1819, Lawson No. 13498 TOTAL 11.60 7.80 28.00 11.00 2.40 NO BID
8. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 81660 Eiko 1819 GE 1819 HALCO 66018
60 ea. UNIT PRICE 0.45 0.29 0.54 0.43 0.36 0.57
LAMP MINIATURE 6W 130V CLEAR, GE 6S6, Eiko 6S6 130K, Lawson No. 13509 TOTAL 27.00 17.40 32.40 25.80 21.60 34.20
9. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 11369 Philips 248351 Philips 348351 GE 656 HALCO 9042 Philips 6S6 120-130V
40 ea. UNIT PRICE 0.72 0.36 141 0.69 0.12
LAMP 6.3V .25A/T3-1/4 BASE-MINIATURE BAYONET BULB-T-3 1/4, GE 1866, Eiko 1866, Lawson No. 13501 TOTAL 28.80 14.40 56.40 27.60 4.80 NO BID
10. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 1866 Eiko 1866 GE 1866 HALCO 66024
12 ea. UNIT PRICE 9.24 10.63 11.32 9.90 9.45 12.05
Lamp Metal Halida MVR175U ED28 BASE MOGUL MULTIVAPOR, GE 47760, Eiko MH175V, Lawson No. 13487 TOTAL 110.88 127.56 135.84 118.80 113.40 144.60
11. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 47760 Eiko MH175/V Philips 287334 GE MVR 175/U HALCO 108200 Philips MH175/U
60 ea. UNIT PRICE 30.43 29.41 36.32 19.79 20.32 38.68
LAMP SWITCH START METAL HALIDE STD-100W/635 CLEAR BASE MOGUL BT37 CL, Philips MH1000/U/BT37 32150-
5, Laawson No. 13488 TOTAL 1,825.80 1,764.60 2,179.20 1,187.40 1,219.20 2,320.80
Sylvania 64469 Philips HALCO Philips
12. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 18205 M1000/U/BT37 321505 GE MVR1000 MH1500/U/BT37
40 ea. UNIT PRICE 8.15 9.24 8.24 9.90 6.91 8.78
LAMP SODIUM HP 250W BULB-HPS ED-18 BASE-MOGUL SCREW (E39), EIKO LU250, Lawson No. 13531 TOTAL 326.00 369.60 329.60 396.00 276.40 351.20
13. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 85377 Eiko LU250 Philips 368795 GE MVR250/U HALCO 208130 Philips C250S50/ALTO
36 ea. UNIT PRICE 6.52 5.68 5.77 6.25 5.54 6.14
LAMP FLUORESCENT U-BENT 6 IN 120V COOL WHITE Item: Philips FB34/CW/6/EWALT or Halco FB34/CW/6/EF,
Lawson No. 13448 TOTAL 234.72 204.48 207.72 225.00 199.44 221.04
14. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 68051 Philips 423087 Philips 423087 | GE F35/CW/6/U6/WM HALCO 109816 Philips FB40T12/CW/SUPREME/6
15 ea. UNIT PRICE 8.70 8.31 8.24 9.90 5.60 8.78
LAMP SODIUM HP 70W BULB-HPS ED23-1/2 BASE-Mogul Screw (E39), Sylvania LU70, Eiko LU70, Lawson No. 13536 TOTAL 130.50 124.65 123.60 148.50 84.00 131.70
15. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 85368 Eiko LU70 Philips 368696 GE LU70/H/ECO HALCO 208122 Philips C70S62/ALTO
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20 ea. UNIT PRICE 6.52 5.68 15.91 6.25 7.50
LAMP FLUORESCENT U-BENT 3IN, Philips PH3FBFB34C3EW, HALCO FB34CWU3ES/M, Lawson No. 13447 TOTAL 130.40 113.60 318.20 125.00 150.00 NO BID
16. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 68050 Philips 423087 GE F35/CW/C/U3WM [ GE F35/CX41/U3/WM
40 ea. UNIT PRICE 25.00 19.58 28.47 14.35 17.75
LAMP METAL HALIDE 400W CLEAR BASE MOGUL (STREET LAMP @ ASR PLANT), Sylvania MH400 T15, Lawson No.
13490 TOTAL 1,000.00 783.20 1,138.80 574.00 710.00 NO BID
Sylvania 64575
17. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL Sylvania MH400T15 M400/U/ET18 Eiko MH400 T15 108416
24 ea. UNIT PRICE 1.96 2.22 2.74 2.08 1.84 2.92
LAMP F25-T8-SP30 LENGTH 38 in, GE 15943 TOTAL 47.04 53.28 65.76 49.92 44.16 70.08
Sylvania 21937 Philips GE HALCO Philips
18. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 45750 FO25/730/ECO 280974 F25T8/SP30/ECO 109340 F25T8/TL830/PLUS/ALTO
400 ea. UNIT PRICE 1.96 1.85 2.56 2.08 1.84 2.73
LAMP F25-T8-SP41 ECO LENGTH 38 inch, GE 45756 TOTAL 784.00 740.00 1,024.00 832.00 736.00 1,092.00
19. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 45756 Philips 281576 Philips 281915 GE F25T8/SP30/ECO HALCO 109344 Philips F25T8/TL841/ALTO
30 ea. UNIT PRICE 1.27 1.84 1.87 1.22 2.04 1.99
LAMP F34-CW-RS-WM-ECO LENGTH 38 in, GE 23010 TOTAL 38.10 55.20 56.10 36.60 61.20 59.70
20. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 66649 Philips 423889 Philips 423889 GE F34/LW/L/IWM/ECO HALCO 24588 Philips F40T12/CW/SUPREME/ALTO
12 ea. UNIT PRICE 7.61 6.35 6.10 6.25 5.12 6.49
LAMP F32-T8-SP-30-V6-ECO U Bulb, GE 28145 TOTAL 91.32 76.20 73.20 75.00 61.44 77.88
Sylvania Philips HALCO Philips
21. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 68920 21663FB032/830/6/ECO 378976 GE F32T8SP30/UB/ECO 109500 FB32T8/TL830/6/ALTO
30 ea. UNIT PRICE 2.93 2.88 2.93 2.92 221 3.12
LAMP F32-T8-25W-SPX30-ECO LENGTH 38 in, GE 72128 TOTAL 87.90 86.40 87.90 87.60 66.30 93.60
Sylvania 22454 Philips GE HALCO Philips
22. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 72128 FO32/25W/830/XV/SSIECO 282046 F32T8/25W/SPX30/ECO 109806 F32T8/Adv830/XEW/ALTO 25W
36 ea. UNIT PRICE 1.63 1.54 1.79 1.49 1.34 191
LAMP F32-T8-SP30-Eco 38 in, GE 26666 TOTAL 58.68 55.44 64.44 53.64 48.24 68.76
23. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 66347 Philips 281626 Philips 453662 GE F32T8/SP30/ECO HALCO 109412 Philips F32T8/HL730/ALTO
1,200 ea. UNIT PRICE 1.96 2.22 2.50 2.08 1.84 2.92
LAMP F25-T8-SP30-ECO LENGTH 38 in, GE 45750 F25T8/SP30/ECO, Sylvania 21937 FO25/730 ECO TOTAL 2,352.00 2,664.00 3,000.00 2,496.00 2,208.00 3,504.00
Sylvania Philips GE HALCO Philips
24. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL 45750 21937F025/730/ECO 280974 F25T8/SP30/ECO 109340 F25T8/TL930/PLUS/AUTO
12 ea. UNIT PRICE 9.24 11.32 11.52 9.90 9.45 12.27
LAMP U Bulb style, GE 42729 MVR250-U TOTAL 110.88 135.84 138.24 118.80 113.40 147.24
25. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 42729 Sylvania 64457 M250/U Philips 274845 GE MVR250/U HALCO 108204 Philips MH250/U
150 ea. UNIT PRICE 3.04 2.61 3.84 3.13 0.57 4.09
LAMP 50W-40 degree-T cup, GE 20833 Q50 MR16C-FL40 degree TOTAL 456.00 391.50 576.00 469.50 85.50 613.50
26. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 20833 Philips 378059 Philips 378182 GE Q50 MR16/L/F40 HALCO 107484 Philips 50MRC16/FL36
120 ea. UNIT PRICE 3.32 2.61 2.38 1.78 0.57 2.53
LAMP Halogen Light EXN-12v-20w-38 degree, GE 15042 TOTAL 398.40 313.20 285.60 213.60 68.40 303.60
27. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL 20857 Philips 378059 Philips 378034 Eiko Exn HALCO 107480 Philips 20MR16/FL36
130 ea. UNIT PRICE 5.56 6.76 6.15 5.86 4.60 6.55
LAMP Halogen Light (Frosted FG) 37mm ALR FL32 DC Bayonet Base, Eiko GBF-FR-12v-20w-32 degree 49665 TOTAL 722.80 878.80 799.50 761.80 598.00 851.50
28. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL Eiko 49665 Eiko 49665 GBF-FR Philips 340034 Eiko GBF-FR HALCO 68055 Philips 20ALR12/FL32 GBL
80 ea. UNIT PRICE 3.32 2.67 3.96 3.18 0.57 4.22
LAMP BAB-CG-20857-12V-20W-40 degree, GE Precise MR 16 TOTAL 265.60 213.60 316.80 254.40 45.60 337.60
Sylvania 54306 Philips GE HALCO Philips
29. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 20857 20MR16/FL35/C-BAB 378158 BAB 107480 20MRC16/FL36BAB
100 ea. UNIT PRICE 3.04 2.61 3.84 3.13 0.57 4.09
LAMP EXN-20833-Q50MR16C-FL40 degree-12V-50W-40 degree beam, GE Precise MR16 TOTAL 304.00 261.00 384.00 313.00 57.00 409.00
30. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 20833 Philips 378059 Philips 378182 GE Q50MR16/C/FL40 HALCO 107484 Philips 50MRC16/FL36 EXN
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200 ea. UNIT PRICE 3.42 4.53 4.77 3.28 1.70 5.08
LAMP BIAX D ECO 26 W 4pin, GE F26DBX/835/ECO TOTAL 684.00 906.00 954.00 656.00 340.00 1,016.00
Sylvania 21114 Philips GE HALCO Philips
31. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 97612 CF26DD/835/ECO 383232 F26 DBX 835 ECO 109092 PL-C 26W/830/ALTO
24 ea. UNIT PRICE 2.17 4.20 2.87 0.78 0.99
LAMP Halogen 130V-100W-78MM-R7S, Hikari TOTAL 52.08 100.80 68.88 18.72 23.76 NO BID
Sylvania 58887 HIBUCH1 HALCO
32. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 22489 100T3Q/S/CL/RP Q100T34/CL/130V 107184
120 ea. UNIT PRICE 2.17 291 4.43 2.28 3.09 4.71
LAMP Compact Fluorescent Spiral Bulb, GE FLE20HT3/2/827 TOTAL 260.40 349.20 531.60 273.60 370.80 565.20
Sylvania 29396 Philips GE HALCO Philips
33. Mfr./Model MFR/MODEL GE 15834 CF19EL/MINI/830 414003 FLE20HT3/2/827 109254 EL/MDT2 18W
*
Sub Total for Group 3 TOTAL 15,159.13 15,186.62 18,240.48 12,638.14 11,668.51 16,028.98
EXTENSION 1 623.00 18,769.41
EXTENSION 2 623.00 18,769.41
EXTENSION 3 623.00 18,769.41
Net Net Net Net Net Net
TERMS 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days
DELIVERY DAYS 5 days 5 days 7 days 1 day 5 days 7-14 days

*LOW BIDDER

BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Bay Tech Supply

Dealers Electrical Supply
Discount Light Depot dba MCOR Lighting
Elliot Electric

Facility Solutions Group
Grainger

Graybar

Lubbock Electric

Mid Coast Electric Supply
PDME

Summit

Voss Lighting

WESCO, Inc.




